
Bid Tabulation 

ITB 64-23

"Feminine & Hygiene Products" 

Ericka Andrew, Buyer 

Email: andrewe@jccal.org 

Item No.: Description: Qty Uom Manufacturer Pkg Product No. Unit Pricing Ext. Pricing Total 

1

Maxi pad, (Always Brand) Super Long w/Flex 

wings, Size 1 ;  Individually Wrapped, or approved 

equal 

240-count Per Case Always Brand 6-packs of ??? H/Always SL

68.18$             68.18$                       

2

Maxi pad, (Always Brand) Super Long w/Flex 

wings, Size 2;  Individually Wrapped, or approved 

equal

240-count Per Case Always Brand 6-packs of ??? H/Always T

68.18$             68.18$                       

3

Maxi pad, (Always Brand) Super Long w/Flex 

wings, Size 3 ; Individually Wrapped, or approved 

equal

52-count Per Case NO BID NO BID NO BID 

-$                -$                          

4

Maxipad, (Always Brand) Extra Overnight; 

w/wings Individually Wrapped, or approved equal
120-count Per Case NO BID NO BID NO BID 

-$                -$                          

5

Maxipads, Size 4-inch Individually Boxed, 250-

count ea./cs or approved equal
250-count Per Case Charm-Tex 

250-count per case H/FSNC1 40.90$             40.90$                       

177.26$           177.26$                     

Item No.: Description: Qty Uom Manufacturer Pkg Product No. Unit Pricing Ext. Pricing Total 

1
Toothpaste – (Crest Brand) Cavity protection, 

regular paste 0.85 oz.  
40 -count Case NO BID NO BID NO BID 

-$                -$                          

2
Toothpaste – Clear Fluoride Gel size 1.5 oz per 

case or approved equal   
144-count Case Charm-Tex 144-count per case H/CG7P15

39.90$             39.90$                       

3

Toothbrush – Shorty Toothbrush 5.5 in length, 

bright orange  color: Individually sealed 144-count 

per case or approved equal 

144-count Case Charm-Tex 144-count per case H/7B20

6.90$              6.90$                         

4

Toothbrush – White,  thumbprint, size 3 144-count 

per case or approved case
144-count Case Charm-Tex 144-count per case H/CTTPTB

16.90$             16.90$                       

63.70$             63.70$                       

Item No.: Description: Qty Uom Manufacturer Pkg Product No. Unit Pricing Ext. Pricing Total 

1

BODY + HAIR SHAMPOO Total Body (DIAL 

BRAND)   1 gal. – 4-count per case or approved 

equal  

4 -count Case Charm-Tex 4-count per case H/GOLD128

58.90$             58.90$                       

1

Feminine & Hygiene Products 

Group I -MaxiPads

Group I MaxiPads - Price Total:

Group II - Toothpaste 

Group I MaxiPads - Price Total:

Group III - Miscellaneous Hygiene Products. Etc. 

Charm-Tex 
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1

Feminine & Hygiene Products 

Charm-Tex 

2

Hygiene Kit in Clear 19 oz. Tumbler, 30 ea/cs  

(NO RAZORS)

1 Each 4 oz Clear (High-Security) Shampoo Shave 

Gel & Body Wash

1 Each 0.85 oz Clear Gel Toothpaste

1 Each Shorty Toothbrush

1 Each 1.5 oz Wrapped Bar of Soap

1 Each .5 oz Clear Stick Deodorant

1 Each 19 oz Clear Tumbler w/Lid

30 -count Case Charm-Tex 30-count per case KIT/JEFFERSON7

52.90$             52.90$                       

3

Vaseline Lip Therapy 0.35 oz., 72 ea/cs or approved 

equal 72-count Case
NO BID NO BID NO BID 

-$                -$                          

4

Deodorant – Clear, Stick, Clear size 0.5 oz., 144-

count per case or approved equal
144-count

Case
Charm-Tex 

144-count per case
H/CTD05

56.90$             56.90$                       

168.70$           168.70$                     

Guaranteed Maximum Discount available if contract is renewed for 2nd Year %

Group I MaxiPads - Price Total:

Delivery is guaranteed not later than __days after order date. 7-14 days

Charm-Tex  

YES

Guaranteed Maximum Discount available if contract is renewed for 3rd Year %

Required Forms

Notification of Intent to Respond YES

Experience Statement YES

Addendum 1 YES

0%

0%

Debarment Statement YES

Signature Form YES

PACA Required Forms YES

Non-Collusion Affidavit YES

Affidavit of Contractor YES

EEOC Form
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Bid Tabulation 

ITB 64-23

"Feminine & Hygiene Products" 

Ericka Andrew, Buyer 

Email: andrewe@jccal.org 

Item No.: Description: Qty Uom Manufacturer Pkg Product No. Unit Pricing Ext. Pricing Total 

1
Maxi pad, (Always Brand) Super Long w/Flex wings, 

Size 1 ;  Individually Wrapped, or approved equal 
240-count Per Case HealthCare Products

250 per case MTI10200C-250 37.88$             37.88$                       

2

Maxi pad, (Always Brand) Super Long w/Flex wings, 

Size 2;  Individually Wrapped, or approved equal
240-count Per Case HealthCare Products

250 per case MT10200C-250 37.88$             37.88$                       

3

Maxi pad, (Always Brand) Super Long w/Flex wings, 

Size 3 ; Individually Wrapped, or approved equal
52-count Per Case HealthCare Products

250 per case MT10200C-250 37.88$             37.88$                       

4
Maxipad, (Always Brand) Extra Overnight; w/wings 

Individually Wrapped, or approved equal
120-count Per Case HealthCare Products 288 per case MT10005W 32.53$             32.53$                       

5
Maxipads, Size 4-inch Individually Boxed, 250-count 

ea./cs or approved equal
250-count Per Case HOSPECO 250 per case 2501M 28.16$             28.16$                       

174.33$           174.33$                     

Item No.: Description: Qty Uom Manufacturer Pkg Product No. Unit Pricing Ext. Pricing Total 

1
Toothpaste – (Crest Brand) Cavity protection, regular 

paste 0.85 oz.  
40 -count Case Colgate 240 per case T01313 155.03$           155.03$                     

2
Toothpaste – Clear Fluoride Gel size 1.5 oz per case or 

approved equal   
144-count Case Freshmint 144 per case GTP15 41.64$             41.64$                       

3

Toothbrush – Shorty Toothbrush 5.5 in length, bright 

orange  color: Individually sealed 144-count per case or 

approved equal 

144-count Case Freshmint
145 per case TBSH 6.93$               6.93$                         

4

Toothbrush – White,  thumbprint, size 3 144-count per 

case or approved case
144-count Case Freshmint

146 per case TB5118 8.49$               8.49$                         

212.09$           212.09$                     

Item No.: Description: Qty Uom Manufacturer Pkg Product No. Unit Pricing Ext. Pricing Total 

1

BODY + HAIR SHAMPOO Total Body (DIAL 

BRAND)   1 gal. – 4-count per case or approved 

equal  

4 -count Case Freshscent 

4 per case TMS128 58.58$             58.58$                       

2

Hygiene Kit in Clear 19 oz. Tumbler, 30 ea/cs  

(NO RAZORS)

1 Each 4 oz Clear (High-Security) Shampoo Shave 

Gel & Body Wash

1 Each 0.85 oz Clear Gel Toothpaste

1 Each Shorty Toothbrush

1 Each 1.5 oz Wrapped Bar of Soap

1 Each .5 oz Clear Stick Deodorant

1 Each 19 oz Clear Tumbler w/Lid

30 -count Case ICS 30 per case KIT-JEF6

114.90$           114.90$                     

3

Vaseline Lip Therapy 0.35 oz., 72 ea/cs or 

approved equal 72-count Case
Vaseline

72 per case 50139 160.72$           160.72$                     

2

Feminine & Hygiene Products 

Group I -MaxiPads

Group I MaxiPads - Price Total:

Group II - Toothpaste 

Group I MaxiPads - Price Total:

Group III - Miscellaneous Hygiene Products. Etc. 

ICS Jail Supplies Inc. 
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2

Feminine & Hygiene Products 

ICS Jail Supplies Inc. 

4

Deodorant – Clear, Stick, Clear size 0.5 oz., 144-

count per case or approved equal
144-count

Case
Freshscent 

144 per case T063 49.20$             49.20$                       

383.40$           383.40$                     

Guaranteed Maximum Discount available if contract is renewed for 2nd Year %

Group I MaxiPads - Price Total:

Delivery is guaranteed not later than __days after order date. 5-7 days/Custom Hygiene Kits 14-21 days ARO 

ICS Jail Supplies Inc. 

YES

Guaranteed Maximum Discount available if contract is renewed for 3rd Year %

Required Forms

Notification of Intent to Respond YES

Bid Form YES

Addendum 1 YES

0%

0%

Debarment Statement YES

Signature Form YES

PACA Required Forms YES

Non-Collusion Affidavit YES

Affidavit of Contractor YES

EEOC Form
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Bid Tabulation 

Item No.: Description: Qty Uom Manufacturer Pkg Product No. Unit Pricing Ext. Pricing Total 

1
Maxi pad, (Always Brand) Super Long w/Flex wings, 

Size 1 ;  Individually Wrapped, or approved equal 
240-count Per Case Hospeco 192 cs MT 38832

33.98$             67.97$                        

2

Maxi pad, (Always Brand) Super Long w/Flex wings, 

Size 2;  Individually Wrapped, or approved equal
240-count Per Case Hospeco 192 cs MT 38832

33.98$             67.97$                        

3

Maxi pad, (Always Brand) Super Long w/Flex wings, 

Size 3 ; Individually Wrapped, or approved equal
52-count Per Case Hospeco 192 cs MT 38832

33.98$             33.98$                        

4
Maxipad, (Always Brand) Extra Overnight; w/wings 

Individually Wrapped, or approved equal
120-count Per Case Hospeco 168 cs MT 64028 34.60$             34.60$                        

5
Maxipads, Size 4-inch Individually Boxed, 250-count 

ea./cs or approved equal
250-count Per Case Hospeco 250 cs MT-4 42.25$             5.00$                          

178.80$           209.52$                      

Item No.: Description: Qty Uom Manufacturer Pkg Product No. Unit Pricing Ext. Pricing Total 

1
Toothpaste – (Crest Brand) Cavity protection, regular 

paste 0.85 oz.  
40 -count Case Proctor & Gamble 240 count/.85 oz Crest 30501 68.80$             68.80$                        

2
Toothpaste – Clear Fluoride Gel size 1.5 oz per case or 

approved equal   
144-count Case Freshmint 144 count/1.5 oz. 2279 73.20$             73.20$                        

3

Toothbrush – Shorty Toothbrush 5.5 in length, bright 

orange  color: Individually sealed 144-count per case or 

approved equal 

144-count Case Dukal
145 count/5.5 oz. 

AP 5.5

31.20$             31.20$                        

4

Toothbrush – White ,  thumbprint, size 3 144-count per 

case or approved case
144-count Case Donovan

144 count/ size 3
AP - #3

25.94$             25.94$                        

199.14$           199.14$                      

Item No.: Description: Qty Uom Manufacturer Pkg Product No. Unit Pricing Ext. Pricing Total 

1

BODY + HAIR SHAMPOO Total Body (DIAL 

BRAND)   1 gal. – 4-count per case or approved 

equal  

4 -count Case Dial Dial Dial 

70.76$             70.76$                        

Group III - Miscellaneous Hygiene Products. Etc. 

Group I MaxiPads - Price Total:

Group I MaxiPads - Price Total:

Group II - Toothpaste 

3

Feminine & Hygiene Products 

Group I -MaxiPads

Budget Janitoral Supply 

ITB 64-23

"Feminine & Hygiene Products" 

Ericka Andrew, Buyer 

Email: andrewe@jccal.org  
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3

Feminine & Hygiene Products 

Budget Janitoral Supply 

2

Hygiene Kit in Clear 19 oz. Tumbler, 30 ea/cs  

(NO RAZORS)

1 Each 4 oz Clear (High-Security) Shampoo Shave 

Gel & Body Wash

1 Each 0.85 oz Clear Gel Toothpaste

1 Each Shorty Toothbrush

1 Each 1.5 oz Wrapped Bar of Soap

1 Each .5 oz Clear Stick Deodorant

1 Each 19 oz Clear Tumbler w/Lid

30 -count Case NO BID NO BID NO BID

-$                 -$                           

3

Vaseline Lip Therapy 0.35 oz., 72 ea/cs or approved 

equal 72-count Case
NO BID NO BID NO BID

-$                 -$                           

4

Deodorant – Clear, Stick, Clear size 0.5 oz., 144-

count per case or approved equal
144-count

Case
NO BID NO BID NO BID

-$                 -$                           

70.76$             70.76$                        

Budget Janitorial Supply 

Group III Misc. Hygiene Products etc. - Price Total:

Delivery is guaranteed not later than __days after order date. 3-7 days

YES

YES

YES

Required Forms

0%

0%Guaranteed Maximum Discount available if contract is renewed for 3rd Year %

Guaranteed Maximum Discount available if contract is renewed for 2nd Year %

Signature Form

PACA Required Forms

Addendum 1

YES

YES

YES

Affidavit of Contractor

EEOC Form

Debarment Statement

YES

YES

YES

Notification of Intent to Respond

Experience Statement

Non-Collusion Affidavit
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Bid Tabulation 

ITB 64-23

"Feminine & Hygiene Products" 

Ericka Andrew, Buyer 

Email: andrewe@jccal.org 

Item No.: Description: Qty Uom Manufacturer Pkg Product No. Unit Pricing Ext. Pricing Total 

1
Maxi pad, (Always Brand) Super Long w/Flex wings, 

Size 1 ;  Individually Wrapped, or approved equal 
240-count Per Case Bob Barker Company 216-count per case 44340-C

22.06$             26.40$                                        

2

Maxi pad, (Always Brand) Super Long w/Flex wings, 

Size 2;  Individually Wrapped, or approved equal
240-count Per Case Bob Barker Company 576-count per case SNWR

51.84$             51.84$                                        

3

Maxi pad, (Always Brand) Super Long w/Flex wings, 

Size 3 ; Individually Wrapped, or approved equal
52-count Per Case Bob Barker Company NO BID NO BID 

-$                 -$                                            

4

Maxipad, (Always Brand) Extra Overnight; w/wings 

Individually Wrapped, or approved equal
120-count Per Case Bob Barker Company 288-count per case SN288-C

28.80$             28.80$                                        

5

Maxipads, Size 4-inch Individually Boxed, 250-count 

ea./cs or approved equal
250-count Per Case Bob Barker Company

250-count per case
SN-C

47.50$             47.50$                                        

150.20$           154.54$                                      

Item No.: Description: Qty Uom Manufacturer Pkg Product No. Unit Pricing Ext. Pricing Total 

1
Toothpaste – (Crest Brand) Cavity protection, regular 

paste 0.85 oz.  
40 -count Case Crest 240-count per case PR39000

88.80$             88.80$                                        

2
Toothpaste – Clear Fluoride Gel size 1.5 oz per case or 

approved equal   
144-count Case Maximum Security 

144-count per case
MST15

46.08$             46.08$                                        

3

Toothbrush – Shorty Toothbrush 5.5 in length, bright 

orange  color: Individually sealed 144-count per case or 

approved equal 

144-count Case Bob Barker Company
144-count per case

BBFH30

7.20$               7.20$                                          

4

Toothbrush – White,  thumbprint, size 3 144-count per 

case or approved case
144-count Case Bob Barker Company 72-count per case TH42

4.32$               8.64$                                          

146.40$           150.72$                                      

4

Feminine & Hygiene Products 

Group I -MaxiPads

Group I MaxiPads - Price Total:

Group II - Toothpaste 

Group I MaxiPads - Price Total:

Bob Barker Company
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4

Feminine & Hygiene Products 

Bob Barker Company

Item No.: Description: Qty Uom Manufacturer Pkg Product No. Unit Pricing Ext. Pricing Total 

1

BODY + HAIR SHAMPOO Total Body (DIAL 

BRAND)   1 gal. – 4-count per case or approved 

equal  

4 -count Case DIAL 4-count per case 3986

88.84$             88.84$                                        

2

Hygiene Kit in Clear 19 oz. Tumbler, 30 ea/cs  

(NO RAZORS)

1 Each 4 oz Clear (High-Security) Shampoo Shave 

Gel & Body Wash

1 Each 0.85 oz Clear Gel Toothpaste

1 Each Shorty Toothbrush

1 Each 1.5 oz Wrapped Bar of Soap

1 Each .5 oz Clear Stick Deodorant

1 Each 19 oz Clear Tumbler w/Lid

30 -count Case Bob Barker Company

30-count per case          

**22 oz kits 

offered***

C1213-KIT

58.50$             58.50$                                        

3

Vaseline Lip Therapy 0.35 oz., 72 ea/cs or approved 

equal 72-count Case
Vaseline 144-count per case 27507

131.04$           131.04$                                      

4

Deodorant – Clear, Stick, Clear size 0.5 oz., 144-

count per case or approved equal
144-count

Case
Maximum Security 144-count per case FD-05

72.00$             72.00$                                        

350.38$           350.38$                                      

Guaranteed Maximum Discount available if contract is renewed for 2nd Year %

Group III - Miscellaneous Hygiene Products. Etc. 

Group I MaxiPads - Price Total:

Delivery is guaranteed not later than __days after order date. 3-5 days/14-30 days 

Bob Barker Company

YES

Guaranteed Maximum Discount available if contract is renewed for 3rd Year %

Required Forms

Notification of Intent to Respond YES

Experience Statement YES

Addendum 1 YES

0%

0%

Debarment Statement YES

Signature Form YES

PACA Required Forms YES

Non-Collusion Affidavit YES

Affidavit of Contractor Incomplete 

EEOC Form
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Bid Tabulation 

ITB 64-23

"Feminine & Hygiene Products" 

Ericka Andrew, Buyer 

Email: andrewe@jccal.org 

Item No.: Description: Qty Uom Manufacturer Pkg Product No. Unit Pricing Ext. Pricing Total 

1

Maxi pad, (Always Brand) Super Long w/Flex 

wings, Size 1 ;  Individually Wrapped, or approved 

equal 

240-count Per Case Amerfresh 10/pk 25 pk per 

case

AF-250-W

26.20$             26.20$                       

2

Maxi pad, (Always Brand) Super Long w/Flex 

wings, Size 2;  Individually Wrapped, or approved 

equal

240-count Per Case Amerfresh 10/pk 25 pk per 

case

AF-290-W

29.95$             29.95$                       

3

Maxi pad, (Always Brand) Super Long w/Flex 

wings, Size 3 ; Individually Wrapped, or approved 

equal

52-count Per Case Amerfresh 10/pk 25 pk per 

case

AF-290-IN

27.95$             27.95$                       

4

Maxipad, (Always Brand) Extra Overnight; 

w/wings Individually Wrapped, or approved equal
120-count Per Case

??????? ??????? ??????? 34.50$             34.50$                       

5

Maxipads, Size 4-inch Individually Boxed, 250-

count ea./cs or approved equal
250-count Per Case

Hospeco 250/case MT-4 46.50$             46.50$                       

165.10$           165.10$                     

Item No.: Description: Qty Uom Manufacturer Pkg Product No. Unit Pricing Ext. Pricing Total 

1
Toothpaste – (Crest Brand) Cavity protection, 

regular paste 0.85 oz.  
40-count Case Amerfresh 

144 per box TP-085 26.64$             26.64$                       

2
Toothpaste – Clear Fluoride Gel size 1.5 oz per case 

or approved equal   
144-count Case Amerfresh 

144 per case TP-15-G 39.96$             39.96$                       

3

Toothbrush – Shorty Toothbrush 5.5 in length, bright 

orange  color: Individually sealed 144-count per case or 

approved equal 

144-count Case Amerfresh 
144 per pack TBSH-White 21.60$             21.60$                       

4

Toothbrush – White,  thumbprint, size 3 144-count per 

case or approved case
144-count Case Amerfresh 

TB-SEC TB-SEC 21.60$             21.60$                       

109.80$           109.80$                     

Item No.: Description: Qty Uom Manufacturer Pkg Product No. Unit Pricing Ext. Pricing Total 

1

BODY + HAIR SHAMPOO Total Body (DIAL 

BRAND)   1 gal. – 4-count per case or approved 

equal  

4 -count Case Amerfresh 4 per case

3 in 1 Gal 56.00$             56.00$                       

5

Feminine & Hygiene Products 

Group I -MaxiPads

Group I MaxiPads - Price Total:

Group II - Toothpaste 

Group I MaxiPads - Price Total:

Group III - Miscellaneous Hygiene Products. Etc. 

Americare Products Inc. 

Prepared by E.Andrew 06.21.23 Page 9 of 17



5

Feminine & Hygiene Products 

Americare Products Inc. 

2

Hygiene Kit in Clear 19 oz. Tumbler, 30 ea/cs  

(NO RAZORS)

1 Each 4 oz Clear (High-Security) Shampoo Shave 

Gel & Body Wash

1 Each 0.85 oz Clear Gel Toothpaste

1 Each Shorty Toothbrush

1 Each 1.5 oz Wrapped Bar of Soap

1 Each .5 oz Clear Stick Deodorant

1 Each 19 oz Clear Tumbler w/Lid

30 -count Case Amerfresh 30 kits/case

AMK-6-JCC 77.40$             77.40$                       

3

Vaseline Lip Therapy 0.35 oz., 72 ea/cs or approved 

equal 72-count Case
Vaseline 

72 per case VLP-036 130.50$           130.50$                     

4

Deodorant – Clear, Stick, Clear size 0.5 oz., 144-

count per case or approved equal
144-count

Case
Amercare

144 per case STD-05 49.68$             49.68$                       

313.58$           313.58$                     

Guaranteed Maximum Discount available if contract is renewed for 2nd Year %

Group I MaxiPads - Price Total:

Delivery is guaranteed not later than __days after order date. 14 days

Amercare Products Ins. 

YES

Guaranteed Maximum Discount available if contract is renewed for 3rd Year %

Required Forms

Notification of Intent to Respond YES

Experience Statement YES

Addendum 1 YES

0%

0%

Debarment Statement YES

Signature Form YES

PACA Required Forms YES

Non-Collusion Affidavit YES

Affidavit of Contractor YES

EEOC Form
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Bid Tabulation 

ITB 64-23

"Feminine & Hygiene Products" 

Ericka Andrew, Buyer 

Email: andrewe@jccal.org 

Item No.: Description: Qty Uom Manufacturer Pkg Product No. Unit Pricing Ext. Pricing Total 

1

Maxi pad, (Always Brand) Super Long w/Flex 

wings, Size 1 ;  Individually Wrapped, or approved 

equal 

240-count Per Case NO BID NO BID NO BID 

-$                -$                           

2

Maxi pad, (Always Brand) Super Long w/Flex 

wings, Size 2;  Individually Wrapped, or approved 

equal

240-count Per Case NO BID NO BID NO BID 

-$                -$                           

3

Maxi pad, (Always Brand) Super Long w/Flex 

wings, Size 3 ; Individually Wrapped, or approved 

equal

52-count Per Case NO BID NO BID NO BID 

-$                -$                           

4

Maxipad, (Always Brand) Extra Overnight; 

w/wings Individually Wrapped, or approved equal
120-count Per Case NO BID NO BID NO BID 

-$                -$                           

5

Maxipads, Size 4-inch Individually Boxed, 250-

count ea./cs or approved equal
250-count Per Case NO BID NO BID NO BID 

-$                -$                           

-$                -$                           

Item No.: Description: Qty Uom Manufacturer Pkg Product No. Unit Pricing Ext. Pricing Total 

1
Toothpaste – (Crest Brand) Cavity protection, 

regular paste 0.85 oz.  
40 -count Case New World Imports

5/144 or 720 per 

case 
TB85

108.62$           108.62$                     

2
Toothpaste – Clear Fluoride Gel size 1.5 oz per 

case or approved equal   
144-count Case New World Imports 144 per case CG15

35.42$             35.42$                       

3

Toothbrush – Shorty Toothbrush 5.5 in length, 

bright orange  color: Individually sealed 144-count 

per case or approved equal 

144-count Case New World Imports 1440 per case TBSH

67.05$             67.05$                       

4

Toothbrush – White,  thumbprint, size 3 144-count 

per case or approved case
144-count Case New World Imports 720 per case TBSEC

47.38$             47.38$                       

258.47$           258.47$                     

Item No.: Description: Qty Uom Manufacturer Pkg Product No. Unit Pricing Ext. Pricing Total 

1

BODY + HAIR SHAMPOO Total Body (DIAL 

BRAND)   1 gal. – 4-count per case or approved 

equal  

4 -count Case New World Imports 4 per case (1-gal) FS128

31.11$             31.11$                       

6

Feminine & Hygiene Products 

Group I -MaxiPads

Group I MaxiPads - Price Total:

Group II - Toothpaste 

Group II Toothpaste - Price Total:

Group III - Miscellaneous Hygiene Products. Etc. 

Always Available Wholesales & Supply Services 
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6

Feminine & Hygiene Products 

Always Available Wholesales & Supply Services 

2

Hygiene Kit in Clear 19 oz. Tumbler, 30 ea/cs  

(NO RAZORS)

1 Each 4 oz Clear (High-Security) Shampoo Shave 

Gel & Body Wash

1 Each 0.85 oz Clear Gel Toothpaste

1 Each Shorty Toothbrush

1 Each 1.5 oz Wrapped Bar of Soap

1 Each .5 oz Clear Stick Deodorant

1 Each 19 oz Clear Tumbler w/Lid

30 -count Case NO BID NO BID NO BID 

-$                -$                           

3

Vaseline Lip Therapy 0.35 oz., 72 ea/cs or 

approved equal 72-count Case
NO BID NO BID NO BID 

-$                -$                           

4

Deodorant – Clear, Stick, Clear size 0.5 oz., 144-

count per case or approved equal
144-count

Case
New World Imports 576 per case STD5

197.00$           197.00$                     

228.11$           228.11$                     

Guaranteed Maximum Discount available if contract is renewed for 2nd Year %

Group III Miscellaneous Hygiene Products Etc. - Price Total:

Delivery is guaranteed not later than __days after order date. 21 days

Always Available Wholesales & Supply Services 

EEOC Form YES

Guaranteed Maximum Discount available if contract is renewed for 3rd Year %

Required Forms

Notification of Intent to Respond YES

Bid Form YES

Addendum 1 YES

2%

2%

Debarment Statement YES

Signature Form YES

PACA Required Forms YES

Non-Collusion Affidavit YES

Affidavit of Contractor YES
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Bid Tabulation 

ITB 64-23

"Feminine & Hygiene Products" 

Ericka Andrew, Buyer 

Email: andrewe@jccal.org 

Item No.: Description: Qty Uom Manufacturer Pkg Product No. Unit Pricing Ext. Pricing Total 

1

Maxi pad, (Always Brand) Super Long w/Flex 

wings, Size 1 ;  Individually Wrapped, or approved 

equal 

240-count Per Case #### per case N/A J008-15521678

36.00$             1,440.00$                  

2

Maxi pad, (Always Brand) Super Long w/Flex 

wings, Size 2;  Individually Wrapped, or approved 

equal

240-count Per Case #### per case N/A J009-15521678

36.00$             1,440.00$                  

3

Maxi pad, (Always Brand) Super Long w/Flex 

wings, Size 3 ; Individually Wrapped, or approved 

equal

52-count Per Case #### per case N/A J009-15521678

312.00$           12,480.00$                

4

Maxipad, (Always Brand) Extra Overnight; 

w/wings Individually Wrapped, or approved equal
120-count Per Case #### per case N/A J010-15521678

36.00$             720.00$                     

5

Maxipads, Size 4-inch Individually Boxed, 250-

count ea./cs or approved equal
250-count Per Case

252- count 
N/A J010-15521678

216.00$           216.00$                     

636.00$           16,296.00$                

Item No.: Description: Qty Uom Manufacturer Pkg Product No. Unit Pricing Ext. Pricing Total 

1
Toothpaste – (Crest Brand) Cavity protection, 

regular paste 0.85 oz.  
40 -count Case NO BID NO BID NO BID 

-$                -$                           

2
Toothpaste – Clear Fluoride Gel size 1.5 oz per 

case or approved equal   
144-count Case NO BID NO BID NO BID 

-$                -$                           

3

Toothbrush – Shorty Toothbrush 5.5 in length, 

bright orange  color: Individually sealed 144-count 

per case or approved equal 

144-count Case NO BID NO BID NO BID 

-$                -$                           

4

Toothbrush – White,  thumbprint, size 3 144-count 

per case or approved case
144-count Case NO BID NO BID NO BID 

-$                -$                           

-$                -$                           

Item No.: Description: Qty Uom Manufacturer Pkg Product No. Unit Pricing Ext. Pricing Total 

1

BODY + HAIR SHAMPOO Total Body (DIAL 

BRAND)   1 gal. – 4-count per case or approved 

equal  

4 -count Case NO BID NO BID NO BID 

-$                -$                           

2

Hygiene Kit in Clear 19 oz. Tumbler, 30 ea/cs  

(NO RAZORS)

1 Each 4 oz Clear (High-Security) Shampoo Shave 

Gel & Body Wash

1 Each 0.85 oz Clear Gel Toothpaste

1 Each Shorty Toothbrush

1 Each 1.5 oz Wrapped Bar of Soap

1 Each .5 oz Clear Stick Deodorant

1 Each 19 oz Clear Tumbler w/Lid

30 -count Case NO BID NO BID NO BID 

-$                -$                           

7

Feminine & Hygiene Products 

Group I -MaxiPads

Group I MaxiPads - Price Total:

Group II - Toothpaste 

Group I MaxiPads - Price Total:

Group III - Miscellaneous Hygiene Products. Etc. 

Rush Ministries LLC dba "Love The Comfort"
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7

Feminine & Hygiene Products 

Rush Ministries LLC dba "Love The Comfort"

3

Vaseline Lip Therapy 0.35 oz., 72 ea/cs or 

approved equal 72-count Case
NO BID NO BID NO BID 

-$                -$                           

4

Deodorant – Clear, Stick, Clear size 0.5 oz., 144-

count per case or approved equal
144-count

Case
NO BID NO BID NO BID 

-$                -$                           

-$                -$                           

Guaranteed Maximum Discount available if contract is renewed for 2nd Year %

Group I MaxiPads - Price Total:

Delivery is guaranteed not later than __days after order date. 10 days

Rush Ministries LLC dba "Love The Comfort"

YES

Guaranteed Maximum Discount available if contract is renewed for 3rd Year %

Required Forms

Notification of Intent to Respond YES

Experience Statement NO

Addendum 1 NO

N/A

N/A

Debarment Statement YES

Signature Form YES

PACA Required Forms YES

Non-Collusion Affidavit YES

Affidavit of Contractor YES

EEOC Form
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Bid Tabulation 

ITB 64-23

"Feminine & Hygiene Products" 

Ericka Andrew, Buyer 

Email: andrewe@jccal.org 

Item No.: Description: Qty Uom Manufacturer Pkg Product No. Unit Pricing Ext. Pricing Total 

1

Maxi pad, (Always Brand) Super Long w/Flex 

wings, Size 1 ;  Individually Wrapped, or approved 

equal 

240-count Per Case NO BID NO BID NO BID 

-$                -$                          

2

Maxi pad, (Always Brand) Super Long w/Flex 

wings, Size 2;  Individually Wrapped, or approved 

equal

240-count Per Case NO BID NO BID NO BID 

-$                -$                          

3

Maxi pad, (Always Brand) Super Long w/Flex 

wings, Size 3 ; Individually Wrapped, or approved 

equal

52-count Per Case NO BID NO BID NO BID 

-$                -$                          

4

Maxipad, (Always Brand) Extra Overnight; 

w/wings Individually Wrapped, or approved equal
120-count Per Case NO BID NO BID NO BID 

-$                -$                          

5

Maxipads, Size 4-inch Individually Boxed, 250-

count ea./cs or approved equal
250-count Per Case NO BID NO BID NO BID 

-$                -$                          

-$                -$                          

Item No.: Description: Qty Uom Manufacturer Pkg Product No. Unit Pricing Ext. Pricing Total 

1
Toothpaste – (Crest Brand) Cavity protection, 

regular paste 0.85 oz.  
40 -count Case NO BID NO BID NO BID 

-$                -$                          

2
Toothpaste – Clear Fluoride Gel size 1.5 oz per 

case or approved equal   
144-count Case Glister Multi-Action 6-count per case 126001

454.90$          909.79$                     

3

Toothbrush – Shorty Toothbrush 5.5 in length, 

bright orange  color: Individually sealed 144-count 

per case or approved equal 

144-count Case NO BID NO BID NO BID 

-$                -$                          

4

Toothbrush – White,  thumbprint, size 3 144-count 

per case or approved case
144-count Case Glister Advanced 4-count per case 100957C

473.85$          947.70$                     

928.75$          1,857.49$                  

Item No.: Description: Qty Uom Manufacturer Pkg Product No. Unit Pricing Ext. Pricing Total 

1

BODY + HAIR SHAMPOO Total Body (DIAL 

BRAND)   1 gal. – 4-count per case or approved 

equal  

4 -count Case G and H Nourish Body Wash 
4-count per case 

(1-liter)
123396D

96.88$            193.75$                     

8

Feminine & Hygiene Products 

Group I -MaxiPads

Group I MaxiPads - Price Total:

Group II - Toothpaste 

Group I MaxiPads - Price Total:

Group III - Miscellaneous Hygiene Products. Etc. 

C W Nowlin Enterprises LLC 
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8

Feminine & Hygiene Products 

C W Nowlin Enterprises LLC 

2

Hygiene Kit in Clear 19 oz. Tumbler, 30 ea/cs  

(NO RAZORS)

1 Each 4 oz Clear (High-Security) Shampoo Shave 

Gel & Body Wash

1 Each 0.85 oz Clear Gel Toothpaste

1 Each Shorty Toothbrush

1 Each 1.5 oz Wrapped Bar of Soap

1 Each .5 oz Clear Stick Deodorant

1 Each 19 oz Clear Tumbler w/Lid

30 -count Case NO BID NO BID 

3

Vaseline Lip Therapy 0.35 oz., 72 ea/cs or 

approved equal 72-count Case
Artistry Studio Lip Balm 72-count per case 124819

1,516.32$       3,032.64$                  

4

Deodorant – Clear, Stick, Clear size 0.5 oz., 144-

count per case or approved equal
144-count

Case
G and H Protect Deodorant

144-count per case
298153

1,440.50$       2,881.01$                  

3,053.70$       6,107.40$                  

Guaranteed Maximum Discount available if contract is renewed for 2nd Year %

Group I MaxiPads - Price Total:

Delivery is guaranteed not later than __days after order date. 5 days

C W Nowlin Enterprises LLC 

YES

Guaranteed Maximum Discount available if contract is renewed for 3rd Year %

Required Forms

Notification of Intent to Respond YES

Experience Statement Incomplete 

Addendum 1 NO 

AmPerks "See"

AmPerks "See"

Debarment Statement YES

Signature Form YES

PACA Required Forms YES

Non-Collusion Affidavit YES

Affidavit of Contractor YES

EEOC Form
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Bid Tabulation 

ITB 64-23

"Feminine & Hygiene Products" 

Ericka Andrew, Buyer 

Email: andrewe@jccal.org 

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

Address: 90 Pardue Road Pelham Al  35124 | Contact: Steven L. Savage | Ph: 205-663-1882   Fax: 205-663-2088 | Email: 

ssavage@bjsupply.com 

 Always Available 

Wholesale & Supply  

Address: 464 Bass Circle Huntsville, AL  35801 | Contact: Debra Holt                                                                                                         

|Ph: 1-888-412-3246 | Email: officemanager@alwayswholesales.net 

 C.W. Nowlin 

Enterprises 

Address: 336 Riverview Road Madison Amheist VA  24572  | Contact:  Christopher Wayne Nowlin | Ph: 434-770-0285                                                                               

| Email: cwnowlin2012@gmail.com 

Contact Information

 Bob Barker Company 

Inc.  

Address: 7925 Purfoy Road Fuquay Varina NC  27526  | Contact: Betsy Copeland | Ph: 919-753-1654                                          

Fax: 1-800-322-7537  | Email: betsycopeland@bobbarker.com

 Americare Products 

Inc.  

Address: 17661 128th Place NE Woodinville, WA  98072 | Contact: Julie Sigel                                                                                                                                                                                                            

|Ph: 1-800-556-6322 | Email: julie@amercareproducts.net 

 Rush Ministries 

LLC/Love The 

Comfort 

Address: 351 24th St. North #1921 Birmingham AL  35203| Contact: David Rush Jr.                                                                                                                                                                                                                            

|Ph: 205-600-7017 | Email: lovethecomfort@gmail.com 

 Charm-Tex 
Address: 1618 Coney  Island Avenue Kings, NY  11230 | Contact:  Stan Danzger                                                                                                                                              

| Ph: 800-221-3147 | Fax: 718-258-8303  | Email: stan@charm-tex.com 

 ICS Jail Supplies Inc.  
Address: P.O. Box 210589 Waco, Tx  76702-1056 | Contact: JM Bogan III | Ph: 800-524-5427 |  Fax: 254-751-0299                    

|Email: biddesk@icswaco.com

 Budget Janitorial 

Supply 
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